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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

FFE (Foundation for Excellence) - 2018 to 2023
Shubha Biradar <shubha.biradar@ffe.org> Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 3:47 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Dear Sir,

Thank you for your email. I approve and agree that the information provided is correct. 

Best Regards

Shubha Biradar
Head -  Scholarships & Technology
www.linkedin.com/in/shubhabiradar/

Foundation For Excellence | https://ffe.org
No. 840, "MHT House", 1st Floor, 5th Main, Indiranagar 1st Stage
Bengaluru - 560 038
Mobile: 8618590754

On Wed, Oct 18, 2023 at 1:12 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Madam,

We are forwarding herewith the year-wise FFE (Foundation for Excellence) number of beneficiary and total scholarship
amount details along with beneficiary students details attached, requesting your kind approval of the same. This is our College
record purpose.

 

Sl No Year No of

Beneficiary

Total Amount

benefited

01 2022-2023 (Admission Batch 2022) 115 51,00,000

02 2021-2022 (Admission Batch 2021) 119 57,13,800

03 2020-2021 (Admission Batch 2020) 106 52,37,450

04 2019-2020 (Admission Batch 2019) 93 50,20,800

05 2018-2019 (Admission Batch 2018) 82 45,16,550
 

Thanking you

Dr D Ranganath

-------------------------------------------------------
Dr. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysuru road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:080-6818-8269
Mobile: 9886130504

http://www.linkedin.com/in/shubhabiradar/
https://ffe.org/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/5th+Main,+Indiranagar+1st+Stage+Bengaluru+-+560+038?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/5th+Main,+Indiranagar+1st+Stage+Bengaluru+-+560+038?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in


      

           Cognizant Foundation 

            5/535, Old Mahabalipuram Road, 
          Okkiyam, Thoraipakkam, 
           Chennai – 600097, Tamil Nadu  
                                                   Email:CognizantFoundation@cognizant.com                                                                         

                                                                                                                              
       www.cognizantfoundation.org 

 
 

December 1, 2023 

Dr. Geetha K. S. 
RV College of Engineering 
Mysore Road, RV Vidyanikethan Post 
Bengaluru- 560059 
 
Dear Mam, 
 

Sub: Cognizant Foundation Scholarships for the academic year 2019-20, 2021-22 and 2022-23 
 

We acknowledge receipt of your letter (along with its enclosure), giving us the names of students (of the 1st , 
year Undergraduate Programme) who have been selected for the award of the above scholarship for the 
batch 2019-20 for their renewal for 2020-21 and 2021-22 academic year.  
 

We are pleased to process the scholarship amount – each for Rs 60,000/- in favour of the following 3 students. 
 

S. 
No 

Name Branch 
of 
Study 

Batch Online Reference 
Number 

Dated Amount 

1 Nikiram C CSE 2019-20 N335222228299048 1/12/2022 1,80,000 

2 Prajwal Vijay Kamble CSE 2019-20 N335222228289969 1/12/2022 1,80,000 

3 Anupama Shalavadi CSE 2019-20 N335222228305749 1/12/2022 1,80,000 

 
We have done online transaction to the above successful students with our best wishes for their continued 
excellent academic performance during their Undergraduate Programme. 
 

Please also arrange to get receipts (as per sample format enclosed) from the 3 students in respect of the 
scholarship amount and forward these receipts to us at the earliest, for our records. 
 

With best wishes, 
 

Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
Rajashree Natarajan 
Chief Executive Officer 
 
Enclosures :   
1 ) Sample format of Receipt. 
 

mailto:CognizantFoundation@cognizant.com
http://www.cognizantfoundation.org/
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Raghuvendra singh foundation
Satyaprakash Singh <satyaraghumail@gmail.com> Tue, Apr 6, 2021 at 12:46 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

 

Dear Sir

 

Pl ref your mail of  19th March 2021     

We have deposited a payment of Rs 2,98,000/= ,  on 30th March 2021 ,  crediting The Principal RVCE . This is towards the 
Raghuvendra Singh Foundation Scholarship for students in RVCE. We had earlier in the year transferred Rs 2,59,000/ = to
the same account. This makes a total of  Rs 5,57,000/= for the year as scholarship to students shortlisted by you. Please
acknowledge receipt of the same.

Further we would like to mention that we have been disbursing scholarships to help poor and meritorious students for many
years now. The object was to enable these students to graduate and get into a gainful employment/profession.  Many of
these   students have  now graduated and with the background of the prestigious RVCE, would be a part of the working
community now . 

I am happy and proud, that we have shared  a part of the journey with  these students.

However we would like to bring up a couple of  points for consideration .

1.              In the format of selection we had mentioned and expected that the beneficiaries of Raghuvendra
Singh  Foundation  Scholarship , would   on beginning their destined jobs would return some amounts   to the
Scholarship funds. It was expected and was not mandatory. As the primary objective was to continuously strengthen
the  Foundation for future aspiring students.

2.              In light of the fact that most of the beneficiaries would now be gainfully employed, it is  unfortunate  that no 
beneficiary  has come forward to contribute to the scholarship fund thus far and be a part of this noble cause. 

We  would like to have a meeting with your good selves  to chalk out a new process / format and revised fund allocation for
granting scholarship . We would  like your advice and seek help in  devising a process whereby  the beneficiaries
subsequent to entering employment , would refund at least some amount to  help create a steady flow of funds  to the
foundation .

We will seek an appointment with you when the  epidemic situation improves and is more conducive to movement in the
near future .    

We also request you to use your good offices to write to the graduated beneficiaries to help strengthen the foundation funds
so that we could help many more of the  students in future .

In view of the above and  the fact that we have already transferred Rs 557000/=  for the year I request you to not process
any further scholarship requests / disbursals for this year. 

For the next academic session we would first like to finalise the strategy and then move forward with the selection process
for the students.

 

With regards

S P Singh

Trustee .

On Fri, Mar 19, 2021 at 9:45 AM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:

mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Raghuvendra singh foundation
Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> Fri, Mar 19, 2021 at 9:45 AM
To: Satyaprakash Singh <satyaraghumail@gmail.com>

Respected sir,
 
We would like to inform you that, we have finalised Pending scholarship nominations from 3rd Semester students  
(4 students from BE, 2 students from M.Tech), for the academic year 2019-2020,
 
We are forwarding herewith nominated list for your kind reference and further needful. 
 

Department of Placement & Training, 3rd Semester Scholarship Application list for RSFS

Sl No Name USN Program SSLC PUC Rank
CGPA (till

last
semester)

Income
certificate

Scholarship
Amount

1 Sidram Hipparagi 1RV19CV098 BE 10.00 86.50 7452 8.00 20,000.00 51,000.00

2 Annapoorna N 1RV19CV013 BE 98.24 92.50 7934 6.43 2,00,000.00 51,000.00

3 Deepika G 1RV19IM019 BE 10.00 96.60 7830 7.23 65,000.00 51,000.00

4 P R Badrinath 1RV19IM039 BE 85.44 82.66 22602 7.88 96,000.00 51,000.00

5 Suresh 1RV18EPE12 M.Tech 70.72 72.70 143 7.02 11,000.00 47,000.00

6
Madhuri Balasaheb
pasare

1RV18EPE05 M.Tech 91.20 84.40 2065 8.19 3,00,000.00 47,000.00

Scholarship  Amount from above application 2,98,000.00
Earlier Scholarship Received on 29.10.2020  For the Academic year-2020 2,59,000.00

Yet to decide from 1st Semester for the A/Y -2020 1,13,000.00
Total Scholarship Amount for the academic year 2020 6,70,000.00

We have yet to decide nominations from 1st year students, due to the ongoing academic Reschedule and present pandemic, it is
getting delayed.
We are in the process of collecting the database.   We will send you the same by next month, Requesting your advice in this
regard.
Once again we thank you for the kind gesture extended towards recognition of meritorious students and awarding
“Raghuvendra Singh Foundation” for our students.

Thanks and Regards

Mohan M.V

On Wed, Oct 7, 2020 at 4:43 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Dear Respected Sir,

We are thankful to you for offering M/s Raghuvendra Singh Foundation Scholarship to our institution to help meritorious
students belonging to the weaker sections of the society. We are forwarding herewith scholarship documents of the below
mentioned students (BE- Renewal application) for your kind perusal. 

 
Sl No Name of the

Beneficiary
Department USN Amount Remarks Batch

01 Ms. Rachitha L IEM

1RV16IM037 79,000.00 Renewal

2016-2020
Passout Batch-
2020

02 Mr. Shivaprada
S Hegde

BT
1RV17BT044 43,000.00 Renewal

2017-2021-
7th Sem

mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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03 Mr. Akshay
Kumar Singh

ECE
1RV17EC009 43,000.00 Renewal

2017-2021-
7th Sem

04
Mr.Lalith Kumar

TCE
1RV18TE079 47,000.00 Renewal

2018-2022-
5th Sem

05
Ms.Pooja

TCE
1RV18TE023 47,000.00 Renewal

2018-2022-
5th Sem

      Total 2,59,000.00    
 

Also we are providing Pending application details for your kind information

01
New Applicant/s From 2019 Batch (BE)

Fresh application

(Batch-2019)

2019-2023(Will send

you by Next month

02
New Applicant/s From 2019 Batch (M.Tech)

Fresh application

(Batch-2019)

2019-2021 (Will send

you by Next month

03
New Applicant/s From 2020 Batch (BE)

Fresh application

(Batch-2020)

2020-2024 (Will send

you by Feb-2021)

04
New Applican/s From 2020 Batch (BE)

Fresh application

(Batch-2020)

2020-2024 (Will send

you by Feb-2021)

       
Due to the modified calendar, we yet to conduct the Interview process for pending applications, once the college reopens, we will
complete the process & immediately we will inform you.

For your reference, we are enclosing certified mark sheets for previous Semester examinations in respect of the above students
(Renewal applicants). With the above-mentioned academic performance, these students have qualified for the renewal of the
Raghuvendra Singh Foundation Scholarships for the academic year 2019-2020,

 

Kindly take these details on your records and arrange for early disbursal of the scholarship cheques for the academic year 2019-
2020 to these students.

 

Renewal Applicant CGPA details as follows
Sl
No

Name of the
Beneficiary

Department USN 1st 2nd 3rd 4th 5th 6th 7th 8th GP

01 Ms. Rachitha L IEM
1RV16IM037

8.24

 

8.00 8.32 7.69 7.69 8.19 8.35 10 8.26

02 Mr. Shivaprada S
Hegde

BT
1RV17BT044

8.84 8.60 9.64 9.16 9.33 9.17 - - 9.13

03 Mr. Akshay Kumar
Singh

ECE
1RV17EC009

9.00 9.20 8.52 8.96 8.28 8.64 - - 8.75

04 Mr.Lalith Kumar TCE 1RV18TE049 9.40 9.45 9.65 9.56 - - - - 9.52

05 Ms.Pooja TCE 1RV18TE023
 

8.25 7.70 7.70

 

7.58 - - - - 7.79

 
(Sir, We have attached authorized letter for you kind information)

Thanking you
Regards
MOHAN M.V
Dept Of Placement & Training
9880797779
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On Thu, Mar 26, 2020 at 1:03 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Sir,
 
Greetings  from RV College of Engineering,
 
Sorry for the delay in sending the nomination for scholarship scheme due to academic schedules.
 
Committee comprising the following Professors had met on 23rd March under the guidance of Principal and
finalized   below beneficiaries for the scheme  including  one girl candidate. The applications received for the
scholarships were   scrutinized thoroughly and identified the candidates since there was no scope for meeting
them personally due to Covid 19 pandemic. The nominations are based on the Means and  academic
performance.
 
The Committee: 
 
1.Dr.H D Gopala Krishna- Professor in Mechanical Engineering & Associate Dean
 
2.Dr.K.Srilakshmi- Professor and Head, Department of Telecommunication Engineering
 
3.Dr,.Renukadevi- Professor in Civil Engineering and Dean-Non-circuit M.Tech programmes
 
4.Dr.Rajashree Shettar-Professor in Computer Science and Dean-Circuit M.Tech programmes 
 
5.Dr.D.Ranganath-Dean Placement and Training
 
The Beneficiaries:
 
 

1.    Mr.Lalith Kumar---4th semester Electronics and Telecommunication Engineering
2.    Ms.Pooja------------4th Semester  Electronics and Telecommunication
Engineering

 
It is  coincidence that both  of them are from Electronics and Telecommunication Engineering but really needs
support in the form of scholarship.
 
RVCE takes this opportunity to extend its sincere thanks and gratitude for the support by Raghuvendra singh
foundation. 

With  regards

Dr.D.Ranganath
Dean-Placement and Training
RVCE,Bangalore

--------------------------------------------- 
Please let us know at your earliest .

Rgds 

S P Singh 

--
Sandhya A.N.
Placement Assistant
080-67178052 /67178372

Prof. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysore road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:67178052 / 080-67178372
Mobile: 9886130504

--
Sandhya A.N.
Placement Assistant

mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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080-67178052 /67178372

Prof. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysore road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:67178052 / 080-67178372
Mobile: 9886130504

--
Sandhya A.N.
Placement Assistant
080-67178052 /67178372

Prof. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysore road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:67178052 / 080-67178372
Mobile: 9886130504
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Universal Flexibles Pvt Ltd Scholarship - Receipt Details
SHARAYU B BADIGER <sharayubb.cs19@rvce.edu.in> Mon, Sep 4, 2023 at 7:46 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Respected sir,

I hereby confirm that I have received the aforementioned amount from Universal Flexibles Pvt Ltd. Also I want to inform
you that the company had paid my college fees of Rs. 99,806 to R.V.College of Engineering Bank account, Hostel fees of
Rs.31,250.00 to RVCE Girls Hostel account and Rs.14,080.00 of mess fees to Ruchisagar Hospitality account i.e., a total of
Rs. 145,136 for the academic year 2022-23. I will share the related documents soon.

Thank you.

Regards
Sharayu B Badiger

On Mon, Sep 4, 2023 at 2:06 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Hi Sharayu 
 
We are forwarding herewith the scholarship amount details provided by Universal Flexible Pvt Ltd S
 

Year Title of Scholarship Number of the
Students

Amount received

2021-22 Means Cum Merit 1       1,67,856.00
2020-21 Means Cum Merit 1       1,61,206.00
2019-20 Means Cum Merit 1       1,78,856.00

 
 
We are hereby requesting your to kindly Confirm the receipt of the same. 
 
Thanking you & Regards
Mohan M.V

Dr. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysuru road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:080-6818-8269
Mobile: 9886130504

mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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