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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

FFE (Foundation for Excellence) - 2018 to 2023
Shubha Biradar <shubha.biradar@ffe.org> Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 3:47 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Dear Sir,

Thank you for your email. I approve and agree that the information provided is correct. 

Best Regards

Shubha Biradar
Head -  Scholarships & Technology
www.linkedin.com/in/shubhabiradar/

Foundation For Excellence | https://ffe.org
No. 840, "MHT House", 1st Floor, 5th Main, Indiranagar 1st Stage
Bengaluru - 560 038
Mobile: 8618590754

On Wed, Oct 18, 2023 at 1:12 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Madam,

We are forwarding herewith the year-wise FFE (Foundation for Excellence) number of beneficiary and total scholarship
amount details along with beneficiary students details attached, requesting your kind approval of the same. This is our College
record purpose.

 

Sl No Year No of

Beneficiary

Total Amount

benefited

01 2022-2023 (Admission Batch 2022) 115 51,00,000

02 2021-2022 (Admission Batch 2021) 119 57,13,800

03 2020-2021 (Admission Batch 2020) 106 52,37,450

04 2019-2020 (Admission Batch 2019) 93 50,20,800

05 2018-2019 (Admission Batch 2018) 82 45,16,550
 

Thanking you

Dr D Ranganath

-------------------------------------------------------
Dr. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysuru road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:080-6818-8269
Mobile: 9886130504

http://www.linkedin.com/in/shubhabiradar/
https://ffe.org/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/5th+Main,+Indiranagar+1st+Stage+Bengaluru+-+560+038?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/5th+Main,+Indiranagar+1st+Stage+Bengaluru+-+560+038?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in


      

           Cognizant Foundation 

            5/535, Old Mahabalipuram Road, 
          Okkiyam, Thoraipakkam, 
           Chennai – 600097, Tamil Nadu  
                                                   Email:CognizantFoundation@cognizant.com                                                                         

                                                                                                                              
       www.cognizantfoundation.org 

 
 

December 1, 2023 

Dr. Geetha K. S. 
RV College of Engineering 
Mysore Road, RV Vidyanikethan Post 
Bengaluru- 560059 
 
Dear Mam, 
 

Sub: Cognizant Foundation Scholarships for the academic year 2019-20, 2021-22 and 2022-23 
 

We acknowledge receipt of your letter (along with its enclosure), giving us the names of students (of the 1st , 
year Undergraduate Programme) who have been selected for the award of the above scholarship for the 
batch 2019-20 for their renewal for 2020-21 and 2021-22 academic year.  
 

We are pleased to process the scholarship amount – each for Rs 60,000/- in favour of the following 3 students. 
 

S. 
No 

Name Branch 
of 
Study 

Batch Online Reference 
Number 

Dated Amount 

1 Nikiram C CSE 2019-20 N335222228299048 1/12/2022 1,80,000 

2 Prajwal Vijay Kamble CSE 2019-20 N335222228289969 1/12/2022 1,80,000 

3 Anupama Shalavadi CSE 2019-20 N335222228305749 1/12/2022 1,80,000 

 
We have done online transaction to the above successful students with our best wishes for their continued 
excellent academic performance during their Undergraduate Programme. 
 

Please also arrange to get receipts (as per sample format enclosed) from the 3 students in respect of the 
scholarship amount and forward these receipts to us at the earliest, for our records. 
 

With best wishes, 
 

Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
Rajashree Natarajan 
Chief Executive Officer 
 
Enclosures :   
1 ) Sample format of Receipt. 
 

mailto:CognizantFoundation@cognizant.com
http://www.cognizantfoundation.org/
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

FW: Payment Advice-BCS_ECS9522023041207540040_19267_952
Sakthivel Murugan (DevOn) <s.murugan@devon.nl>
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>
Cc: "viceprincipal@rvce.edu.in" <viceprincipal@rvce.edu.in>, Dean Academics R V College of Engineering <dean.academics@rvce.edu.in>, "shanmukhan@rvce.edu.in" <shanmukhan@rvce.edu

Dear Sir,

 

We have released the payment of Rs. 735902.00 towards yearly fees for shortlisted students [ as per the enclosed excel file. ] . Request you to kindly acknowledge and disburse the amount to th

 

Second year onwards, you can collect the remaining college fee alone since we are sponsoring govt defined fee.

 

Sl No Name Contact Number Branch CET ComedK Date of Birth Gender Address

1 Lavanya M 8073152388 CSE 529 9/4/2004 Female No 3, Lakshmi nivas,2nd cross, Govindappa layout, near gkm college road, jaraganahalli, jp nagar 7th 

2 Suhas Peri 7337679960 CSE 826 8/2/2004 Male Near Sagar suppliers, basava Sagar Cross, narayanpur road, lingasugur - 584122

3 PRITHIVIRAJ N 8867650966 Data Science 956 5/25/2004 Male #40, balakrishnappa road ,munikallapa garden, ramaswamy palya , Bengaluru 560033

4 MEGHA M K 7676791351 ECE 2672 6/23/2004 Female #132,12th cross,9th main, girinagar 3rd stage, Girinagar, Bangalore 560085

5 Gagana 9353706232 ISE 5011 9/29/2004 Female Neerkere, Ulloor-11, post- moodumata, tq- kundapura, dist- Udupi, pin-576219

6 PRIYANKA N 9742659181 ETE 6477 9/15/2004 Female No 234,8th cross, ullal main road billekalu byadarahalli Bangalore North

7 Arahanth 8951084705 CSE 670 781 5/2/2004 Male #382,57th cross 3rd block Rajajinagar Bangalore

8 Sai varun konda 9353538292 CSE 777   28-02-2005 Male Mailar lingeshwar nilaya near national college (beti circle) keb road sharan nagar bidar 585401

9 HRUTHIK.K.K 8904407936 CSE 244 5/23/2004 Male Mohan Rao Building 1st floor, Gangamma Gudi road, Opp federal bank, M.V.Extn, Hoskote, Bangalore 

10 ASHISHKUMAR G UPPIN 7795710345 ECE 1448 2444 11/26/2004 Male 3552/A RISA

 

 

 

 

 

With Kind Regards,

 

Sakthivel Murugan S

 

IT

 

"Everything you've ever wanted is on the other side of persistence!"

 

M +91 99000 41957  T 080-67298000

 

 

 

 

T   +31 (0)6 -1195 4744

E   info@devon.nl

W  www.devon.nl

 

 

    Transforming organizations to high performing digital enterprises!!                        

 

 

 

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/40,+balakrishnappa+road?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/382,57th+cross+3rd+block+Rajajinagar+Bangalore?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:info@devon.nl
http://www.devon.nl/
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Universal Flexibles Pvt Ltd Scholarship - Receipt Details
SHARAYU B BADIGER <sharayubb.cs19@rvce.edu.in> Mon, Sep 4, 2023 at 7:46 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Respected sir,

I hereby confirm that I have received the aforementioned amount from Universal Flexibles Pvt Ltd. Also I want to inform
you that the company had paid my college fees of Rs. 99,806 to R.V.College of Engineering Bank account, Hostel fees of
Rs.31,250.00 to RVCE Girls Hostel account and Rs.14,080.00 of mess fees to Ruchisagar Hospitality account i.e., a total of
Rs. 145,136 for the academic year 2022-23. I will share the related documents soon.

Thank you.

Regards
Sharayu B Badiger

On Mon, Sep 4, 2023 at 2:06 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Hi Sharayu 
 
We are forwarding herewith the scholarship amount details provided by Universal Flexible Pvt Ltd S
 

Year Title of Scholarship Number of the
Students

Amount received

2021-22 Means Cum Merit 1       1,67,856.00
2020-21 Means Cum Merit 1       1,61,206.00
2019-20 Means Cum Merit 1       1,78,856.00

 
 
We are hereby requesting your to kindly Confirm the receipt of the same. 
 
Thanking you & Regards
Mohan M.V

Dr. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysuru road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:080-6818-8269
Mobile: 9886130504

mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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