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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

FFE (Foundation for Excellence) - 2018 to 2023
Shubha Biradar <shubha.biradar@ffe.org> Thu, Dec 7, 2023 at 3:47 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Dear Sir,

Thank you for your email. I approve and agree that the information provided is correct. 

Best Regards

Shubha Biradar
Head -  Scholarships & Technology
www.linkedin.com/in/shubhabiradar/

Foundation For Excellence | https://ffe.org
No. 840, "MHT House", 1st Floor, 5th Main, Indiranagar 1st Stage
Bengaluru - 560 038
Mobile: 8618590754

On Wed, Oct 18, 2023 at 1:12 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Madam,

We are forwarding herewith the year-wise FFE (Foundation for Excellence) number of beneficiary and total scholarship
amount details along with beneficiary students details attached, requesting your kind approval of the same. This is our College
record purpose.

 

Sl No Year No of

Beneficiary

Total Amount

benefited

01 2022-2023 (Admission Batch 2022) 115 51,00,000

02 2021-2022 (Admission Batch 2021) 119 57,13,800

03 2020-2021 (Admission Batch 2020) 106 52,37,450

04 2019-2020 (Admission Batch 2019) 93 50,20,800

05 2018-2019 (Admission Batch 2018) 82 45,16,550
 

Thanking you

Dr D Ranganath

-------------------------------------------------------
Dr. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysuru road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:080-6818-8269
Mobile: 9886130504

http://www.linkedin.com/in/shubhabiradar/
https://ffe.org/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/5th+Main,+Indiranagar+1st+Stage+Bengaluru+-+560+038?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/5th+Main,+Indiranagar+1st+Stage+Bengaluru+-+560+038?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Universal Flexibles Pvt Ltd Scholarship - Receipt Details
SHARAYU B BADIGER <sharayubb.cs19@rvce.edu.in> Mon, Sep 4, 2023 at 7:46 PM
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

Respected sir,

I hereby confirm that I have received the aforementioned amount from Universal Flexibles Pvt Ltd. Also I want to inform
you that the company had paid my college fees of Rs. 99,806 to R.V.College of Engineering Bank account, Hostel fees of
Rs.31,250.00 to RVCE Girls Hostel account and Rs.14,080.00 of mess fees to Ruchisagar Hospitality account i.e., a total of
Rs. 145,136 for the academic year 2022-23. I will share the related documents soon.

Thank you.

Regards
Sharayu B Badiger

On Mon, Sep 4, 2023 at 2:06 PM Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in> wrote:
Hi Sharayu 
 
We are forwarding herewith the scholarship amount details provided by Universal Flexible Pvt Ltd S
 

Year Title of Scholarship Number of the
Students

Amount received

2021-22 Means Cum Merit 1       1,67,856.00
2020-21 Means Cum Merit 1       1,61,206.00
2019-20 Means Cum Merit 1       1,78,856.00

 
 
We are hereby requesting your to kindly Confirm the receipt of the same. 
 
Thanking you & Regards
Mohan M.V

Dr. D.Ranganath
Dean - Placement & Training
R V College of Engineering, Mysuru road
Bangalore - 560 059
Land line:080-6818-8269
Mobile: 9886130504

mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
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Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>

FW: Payment Advice-BCS_ECS9522023041207540040_19267_952
Sakthivel Murugan (DevOn) <s.murugan@devon.nl>
To: Placement RVCE <placement@rvce.edu.in>
Cc: HR-Blr-DevON <HR-Blr-DevON@devon.nl>, "Vikram Amarnath (DevOn)" <v.amarnath@devon.nl>, Finance Bangalore <fin-blr@devon.nl>

Thanks you Sir,

 

We have initiated the payment, Hopefully by 2nd Jan the payment will be credited to college bank account directly, As we did in last year, we will be releasing the payment as per Govt. approved fe

 

Note : In your list [ enclosed file] Sai Varun Konda name is repeated twice.

 

Sl No Name Contact Number Branch CET ComedK Date of Birth Gender Father's Monthly Income Mother's Monthly Income SSLC/Clas

1 Lavanya M 8073152388 CSE 529 9/4/2004 Female 15000 Nil

2 Suhas Peri 7337679960 CSE 826 8/2/2004 Male 5000 0 Little Flower School , Huligudda , Li

3 PRITHIVIRAJ N 8867650966 Data Science 956 5/25/2004 Male 89000 Mom is house wife P

4 MEGHA M K 7676791351 ECE 2672 6/23/2004 Female 18000 0 VIJAYA BHARATHI VIDYAL

5 Gagana 9353706232 ISE 5011 9/29/2004 Female 3000 - Government Junior 

6 PRIYANKA N 9742659181 ETE 6477 9/15/2004 Female 5000 0 ST LAWRENCE HIGH SCHOOL.,,,, NO 135 KAMAKSHIPA

7 Arahanth 8951084705 CSE 670 781 5/2/2004 Male                  1,50,000.00
                              

      -  TVS

8 Sai varun konda 9353538292 CSE 777   28-02-2005 Male
                              

    - 
                              

      -  Shree swaminarayan gurukul interna

9 HRUTHIK.K.K 8904407936 CSE 244 5/23/2004 Male 4000 No Income Anugraha high school, M.V.Extn, Hoskote, Beng

10 ASHISHKUMAR G UPPIN 7795710345 ECE 1448 2444 11/26/2004 Male 4000 0 AMRITA VIDYAL

 

 

 

With Kind Regards,

Sakthivel Murugan S

IT

"Everything you've ever wanted is on the other side of persistence!"

M +91 99000 41957  T 080-67298000

T   +31 (0)6 -1195 4744

E   info@devon.nl

W  www.devon.nl

    Transforming organizations to high performing digital enterprises!!                            

 

 

From: Placement RVCE placement@rvce.edu.in
Sent: Saturday, December 23, 2023 9:51 AM
To: Sakthivel Murugan (DevOn) s.murugan@devon.nl
Subject: Re: Payment Advice-BCS_ECS9522023041207540040_19267_952

https://www.google.com/maps/search/NO+135+KAMAKSHIPALYA+BENGALURU?entry=gmail&source=g
https://devon.nl/home/
mailto:info@devon.nl
https://devon.nl/home/
https://www.facebook.com/devonNL
https://www.linkedin.com/company/devon
https://twitter.com/devon_nl
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCce4yhNw5kyCAMR4H3CgvCg
https://goo.gl/maps/pkB7hmRWhLSVbTm88
https://careers.devon.global/
mailto:placement@rvce.edu.in
mailto:s.murugan@devon.nl
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